
“NOW MORE THAN EVER… BUCKS 
COUNTY IS MY HOME” VIDEO 
SUBMISSIONS 

TERMS & CONDITIONS: 

Contest is only open to residents of continental United States who are 18 years of age 
or older or have consent from their parent/guardian to participate. 

1. SPONSOR: The Sponsor of the Visit Bucks County “Eat, Drink and Explore in Bucks 
County Summer Photo Contest" is Visit Bucks County (VBC) ("Sponsor" here forth), 
3207 Street Road, Bensalem, PA 19020, telephone: (215) 639-0300, e-mail: 
Marketing@VisitBucksCounty.com. 

2. ENTRY & USE: No purchase is required to submit. To submit a video, users must 
send a :10-:15 second video taken on a mobile phone or other HD camera showing and 
describing why now, more than ever, they are grateful to call Bucks County home to 
Marketing@VisitBucksCounty.com or post it to a public Instagram profile tagging 
@VisitBucksPA and utilizing the hashtag #ExploreInBucksCo. Entrants may post 
multiple times. Result of submitting a video increases chances but does not guarantee a 
feature across Visit Bucks County’s social media channels and/or website. Sponsor 
reserves right to edit and cut video to fit specific time length requirements or to omit 
inappropriate content. 

By submitting video, entrants admit consent to allow Sponsor usage of the video for 
editorial or promotional purposes, specifically via digital advertising campaigns or 
television advertising, promoting Bucks County as a tourist destination. 

Entrant is responsible for all fees charged by any Internet Service Provider. Sponsor 
are/is not responsible or liable for any lost, stolen, mutilated, incomplete, illegible, 
misdirected or non-delivered entries. Upon their receipt, entries become the property of 
Sponsor and will not be returned. Entries are void if received through illegitimate 
channels or are the results of fraud. 

3. ELIGIBILITY: This Contest is open to individual legal residents of the continental 
United States of America who are 18 years of age or older at time of entry. Directors, 
officers, shareholders, employees, and agents of Sponsor, as well as directors, officers, 
shareholders, employees, and agents of advertising and/or promotional partners and 
agencies of Sponsor, and the immediate families (spouse, parents, children, siblings, 
and their spouses) of each of them, are not eligible. Void outside of the United States of 
America, and in any jurisdiction where prohibited or restricted by law. 



4. RELEASE: By submitting video, entrants agree to release, discharge and hold 
harmless Sponsor and its subsidiaries or affiliates, its advertising and promotion 
agencies, and their directors, officers, shareholders, employees and/or agents, from and 
against any and all claims, damages, liability, losses, and expenses arising out of their 
submission. Entrants agree that no claim relating to such claims, damages, liability, 
losses, and expenses shall be asserted against the Sponsor, any of its subsidiaries or 
affiliates, or their respective directors, officers, shareholders, employees and/or agents.  

5. CONDUCT: By submitting video entrants agree to be bound by these Official Rules. 
Entrants further agree to be bound by the decisions of the Sponsor which shall be final 
and binding in all respects. The Sponsor reserves the right, at its sole discretion, to 
disqualify any individual found to be tampering with the entry process; to be acting in 
violation of the Official Rules; or with intent to annoy, abuse, threaten or harass any 
other person. 

6. LIMITATIONS OF LIABILITY: The Sponsor and participating promotional agencies 
(and the subsidiaries and affiliates of each) are not in any way responsible or liable for 
damage, loss, or injury resulting from altered, late, lost, damaged, misdirected, or 
illegible entries, or telephone, computer, online or technical malfunctions (including busy 
lines and disconnections), or acceptance and use of a prize or travel in connection with 
such prize. The Sponsor assumes no responsibility for any error, omission, interruption, 
deletion, defect, or delay in operation or transmission, communications line failure, theft 
or destruction or unauthorized access to, or alteration of entries. The Sponsor is not 
responsible for any problems or technical malfunction of any telephone network or lines, 
computer online systems, servers or providers, computer equipment, software, failure of 
e-mail on account of technical problems or traffic congestion on the Internet or at any 
Web site or combination thereof, including injury or damage to entrants or to any other 
person's computer related or resulting from participation or downloading materials. 

Sponsor reserve the right to change these rules at any time, at its sole discretion. If you 
have questions about these official rules or the contest, please e-mail them to 
Marketing@VisitBucksCounty.com or send written questions to Marketing Department, 
Visit Bucks County, 3207 Street Road, Bensalem, PA 19020. 

 


